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Melkersson-Rosenthal Syndrome: A Rare Entity Not to Be Ignored

Figure 2: Clinical image of fissured tongue.

Figure 1: Clinical image showing macrocheilitis with facial 
paralysis.

Introduction
Melkersson-Rosenthal Syndrome (MRS) is a rare clinical en-
tity defined by the triad of orofacial edema, recurrent facial 
paralysis and fissured tongue. This triad may be incomplete 
or appear at different times [1,2]. We describe the case of two 
patients with chronic and recurrent macrocheilitis, diagnosed 
as Melkersson-Rosenthal syndrome.

Observation 1
This 35-year-old patient, with no previous pathological history, 
had presented for 5 years with persistent labial edema, predom-
inantly in the upper lip, with paroxysmal episodes of aggrava-
tion occurring without any obvious triggering factor and not 
accompanied by laryngeal edema or other allergic signs. 

On examination, there was no change in general condition, no 
digestive signs and no joint symptoms. Examination revealed 
edema of the upper lip with an elastic consistency (Figure 1), 
associated with facial asymmetry and a puckered tongue (Fig-
ure 2). The rest of the examination was unremarkable. Skin 
biopsy revealed a lymphocytic inflammatory infiltrate with no 
specific lesion.

Observation 2
A 30-year-old patient with no previous pathological history 
presented with labial edema that had been evolving for 4 years. 

Clinical examination revealed erosive machrochleitis and se-
quelae of facial asymmetry associated with a puckered tongue. 
Labial biopsy revealed an epithelioid granuloma without ca-
seous necrosis and a lymphocytic inflammatory infiltrate. As-
sessment for sarcoidosis was negative.

Discussion
Melkersson-Rosenthal syndrome is a rare primary or secondary 
granulomatosis, inconsistently associated with facial paralysis 
that may be delayed in time, and a grooved tongue appearance. 
However, it presents a wide variety of clinical symptoms. It 
appears in young adults between the 2nd and 4th decade of life, 
with no predilection for race or sex in our patients, although 
some authors claim a female predominance. 

Indeed, in the majority of cases, the cardinal signs of the dis-
ease do not present synchronously, but appear successively, 
which explains the delay in diagnosis. This is a relatively be-
nign condition, which is only exceptionally life-threatening, 
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but often causes significant cosmetic damage, as was the case 
in our patient [3]. 

Treatment of SMR appears to be a challenge, with several drugs 
having been used including corticosteroid therapy, which may 
not be effective and, in this case, cyclins may be used. Some 
authors have resorted to facial and optic nerve decompression 
surgery in cases of severe damage, and to plastic surgery [4].

Conclusion 
Our cases illustrate the typical clinical presentation of histo-
logically confirmed Melkersson-Rosenthal syndrome, as well 
as the efficacy of oral corticosteroid therapy in the treatment of 
flares and intralesional corticosteroid therapy for macrocheili-
tis [3].
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